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Appendix B 
Retail Establishments Closed by Executive Order 

• Casino gaming floors, including retail sports wagering lounges, and casino concert and 
entertainment venues. Online and mobile sports and casino gaming services may continue to be 
offered notwithstanding the closure of the physical facility. 

• Racetracks, including stabling facilities and retail sports wagering lounges. Mobile sports 
wagering services may continue to be offered notwithstanding the closure of the physical 
facility. 

• Gyms and fitness centers and classes. 
• Entertainment centers, including but not limited to, movie theaters, performing arts centers, 

other concert venues, and nightclubs. 
• All indoor portions of retail shopping malls. Restaurants and other stores located within 

shopping malls that have their own external entrances open to the public, separate from the 
general mall entrance, may remain open pursuant to the terms and directives of this Order for 
operating hours and takeout or food delivery services. All entrances and exits to the common 
area portions of retail shopping malls must remain closed. 

• All places of public amusement, whether indoors or outdoors, including but not limited to, 
locations with amusement parks, water parks, aquariums, zoos, arcades, fairs, children’s play 
centers, funplexes, theme parks, bowling alleys, family and children’s attractions. 

• Facilities where personal care services are performed that, by their very nature, result in 
noncompliance with social distancing guidelines, including but not limited to cosmetology 
shops; barber shops; beauty salons; hair braiding shops; nail salons; electrology facilities; spas, 
including day spas and medical spas, at which solely elective and cosmetic medical procedures 
are performed; massage parlors, tanning salons, tattoo parlors, and public and private social 
clubs, whether or not they serve alcohol, including but not limited to facilities owned or 
operated by the American Legion, Veterans of Foreign Wars, Knights of Columbus, and any 
other social clubs associated with community service organizations. This excludes any health 
facilities that provide medically necessary or therapeutic services.  

• All municipal, county, and State public libraries, and all libraries and computer labs at public and 
private colleges and universities. 

 


